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Description

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
REQUEST APPROVAL TO AWARD BID
MJ Valve Adapters
BID DATE: August 29, 2024

200784 - 4” MJ Valve Adapters

200785 - 6” MJ Valve Adapters

200786 -

202853 -

200787 -

200854 -

200855 -

200856 -

200857 -

8”

10

20

MJ Valve Adapters

” MJ Valve Adapters

” MJ Valve Adapters

” MJ Valve Adapters

” MJ Valve Adapters

” MJ Valve Adapters

” MJ Valve Adapters

GRAND TOTAL

No Bid: 1 - Core & Main, LP

The intial lowest bidder rescinded their bid upon award stating that are unable to honor their pricing because the manufacturere quoted the incorrect materia.

*Lowest Responsible and Responsive bidder

Evaluated By:

INUMBER OF BIDS: 3

Desleda @rom/ Derleda Abrom

*

Empire Pipe & Supply, INC.

Birmingham, AL

Ferguson

Bessemer, AL

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
107.50 10,750.00 $ 97.87 9,787.00
144.89 57,956.00 $ 175.05 70,020.00
210.32 63,096.00 $ 224.28 67,284.00
374.68 18,734.00 $ 387.85 19,392.50
436.22 21,811.00 $ 574.76 28,738.00
684.70 17,117.50 $ 209342 52,335.50
782.85 19,671.25 $ 242337 60,584.25

1,159.86 28,996.50 $  2,945.09 73,627.25
1,385.75 34,643.75 $ 331735 82,933.75
$___ 272676.00 $__ 464,702.25

MINORITY VENDOR BID AWARD: YES OR NO v

NEW VENDOR: YES OR NO Y

Evaluation of Bids MJ Valve Adapters, bid 24-12-10
Bid Date: August 29, 2024
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* Consolidated Pipe
Birmingham, AL

Unit Price

93.23
163.33
209.47

373.00

$
$
$
$
$ 553.00
$ NO Bid
$ NO Bid
$ NO Bid
$ NO Bid

$

Total Price

9,323.00
65,332.00
62,841.00
18,650.00

27,650.00

183,796.00
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