
Description
Janitorial Service per bid * Eagle Cleaning Service, Inc. Hill's Janitorial Service, Inc. Parker & Co. LLC Mr. Klin Services, LLC Pritchard Industries Always Availabale WholeSale
“Specifications & Conditions” for the sum of: Bessemer, AL Gardendale, AL Birmingham, AL Huntsville, AL Birmingham, AL Huntsville, AL

 
Qty Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual

12 Main Office Building- Day Shift $ 1,800.00    21,600.00       $ 1,650.00   19,800.00      $ 4,551.75   54,621.00      $ 1,772.00   21,264.00      $ 1,914.00   22,968.00      No Bid No Bid
12 Main Office Building- Night Shift $ 5,000.00    60,000.00       $ 3,400.00   40,800.00      $ 4,551.75   54,621.00      $ 5,428.00   65,136.00      $ 6,500.00   78,000.00      No Bid No Bid
12 Payment Ctr Bldg. - Day Shift $ 3,800.00    45,600.00       $ 4,160.00   49,920.00      $ 1,668.72   20,024.64      $ 3,600.00   43,200.00      $ 4,350.00   52,200.00      No Bid No Bid
12 Payment Ctr Bldg. - Night Shift $ 4,100.00    49,200.00       $ 4,410.00   52,920.00      $ 1,668.72   20,024.64      $ 3,600.00   43,200.00      $ 4,350.00   52,200.00      No Bid No Bid
12 Transportation Building $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 850.00      10,200.00      $ 224.40      2,692.80        $ 475.00      5,700.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Distribution Building $ 1,805.00    21,660.00       $ 1,520.00   18,240.00      $ 4,029.00   48,348.00      $ 1,830.00   21,960.00      $ 4,350.00   52,200.00      No Bid No Bid
12 E & M Building $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 850.00      10,200.00      $ 690.20      8,282.40        $ 1,030.00   12,360.00      $ 326.25      3,915.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Warehouse Building $ 1,000.00    12,000.00       $ 375.00      4,500.00        $ 297.33      3,567.96        $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Enviro-Lab Building $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 1,300.00   15,600.00      $ 2,074.00   24,888.00      $ 1,830.00   21,960.00      $ 2,175.00   26,100.00      No Bid No Bid
12 Land Admin. Trailer $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 110.00      1,320.00        $ 171.36      2,056.32        $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Water Quality Trailer $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 110.00      1,320.00        $ 224.74      2,696.88        $ 475.00      5,700.00        $ 326.25      3,915.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Environmental Services Trailer $ 215.00       2,580.00         $ 110.00      1,320.00        $ 163.20      1,958.40        $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Engineering Trailer $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 110.00      1,320.00        $ 142.80      1,713.60        $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Pressure Complaints $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 110.00      1,320.00        $ 142.80      1,713.60        $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Guard Shack $ 150.00       1,800.00         $ 110.00      1,320.00        $ 7.65          91.80             $ -            -                 $ 25.00        300.00           No Bid No Bid
12 Industrial & Commercial Trailer $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 110.00      1,320.00        $ 160.65      1,927.80        $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Training Trailer $ 100.00       1,200.00         $ 110.00      1,320.00        $ 142.80      1,713.60        $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 317.50      3,810.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Chemical Plant Building $ 250.00       3,000.00         $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 272.00      3,264.00        $ 360.00      4,320.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
12 Cahaba P.S.Museum $ 200.00       2,400.00         $ 320.00      3,840.00        $ 646.00      7,752.00        $ 360.00      4,320.00        $ 217.50      2,610.00        No Bid No Bid
  

GRAND ANNUAL TOTAL 240,240.00$   240,420.00$  261,958.44$  276,000.00$  319,098.00$  No Bid

*Lowest Responsible and Responsive bidder

Evaluated By:  ___Derleda Abrom__(Derleda A Checked By:  ______________(Jonathan Jett)_________________________________

NUMBER OF BIDS:  5    NO BID: 1      MINORITY VENDOR BID AWARD:  YES   OR   NO        NEW VENDOR:   YES√   OR  NO 
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